
  Public Calendar

January 2016

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday

1 2

Raymond & Thelma
50th Anniversary
Open House
2:00pm - 4:00pm
Raymond and Thelma
50th Anniversary open
house in fellowship
hall.

3

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

Bible Bowl Practise
5:00pm - 6:00pm

Sun PM Worship
Service

4 5 6

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

7 8 9

Girls Day - Lehman
Avenue Church of
Christ
9:30am - 1:30pm
Theme: Daughters of
The King. Lunch will
be provided. If you
have any questions
see Kelsey Gott.

10

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

Bible Bowl Practice
5:00pm - 6:00pm

Sun PM Worship
Service

11 12 13

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

14

Song Leading
Practise
Begins 6:30pm in the
building. Contact
Jason for details.

15

Evangelism
University HS Age -
Savannah, TN
Evangelism
University, for high
school students
grades 9-12, in
Savannah,
Tennessee.

16

Evangelism
University HS Age -
Savannah, TN
Evangelism
University, for high
school students
grades 9-12, in
Savannah,
Tennessee.

17

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

Evangelism
University HS Age -
Savannah, TN
Evangelism
University, for high
school students
grades 9-12, in
Savannah,
Tennessee.

Bible Bowl Practice

18

Evangelism
University HS Age -
Savannah, TN
Evangelism
University, for high
school students
grades 9-12, in
Savannah,
Tennessee.

19 20

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

21

Song Leading
Practise canceled

22 23
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5:00pm - 6:00pm
at the building.

Sun PM Worship
Service

24

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

Rescheduled - Baby
Shower for Will and
Kelsey
2:00pm - 4:00pm
In the fellowship hall.
Everyone is invited.
Rescheduled for
January 31st - 2:00 -
4:00pm

CHANGE IN
SUNDAY
SCHEDULE!!!
2:00 pm. Due to the
weather, the Elders
have decided to
change the Sunday
worship schedule for
this week only. There
will be ONE worship
service beginning at
2:00 PM. There will be
no Sunday School or
night services. Please
be careful and use
your own discretion
about travel. All other
activities are canceled
for Sunday. The baby
shower for Will and
Kelsey Gott has been
moved to Sunday,
January 31 from 2:00
to 4:00 PM. If you
have questions,
please contact any of
our Elders.

4th Sunday night
singing and
fellowship
After evening services
- Meal theme: Soup,
chili, and sandwiches

Elder/Deacons
Meeting
5:00pm - 6:00pm
in the conference
room/library.

Bible Bowl Practice
5:00pm - 6:00pm
at the building!

Sun PM Worship
Service

25 26 27

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

Daniel Gaines
Presentation
7:00pm - 8:00pm
Daniel Gaines will be
making a presentation
to the entire
congregation
Wednesday evening
about his mission
work in Tanzania so
all classes will stay in
the auditorium.

28

Song Leading
Practise
6:30 p.m. Contact
Jason for details

29

Evangelism
University College
Age - Martin TN
For college age in
Martin, Tennessee

Cancelled - Youth
Retreat at Big Reedy
For 7th grade through
college age cancelled.
See Will Gott for more
details.

30

Evangelism
University College
Age - Martin TN
For college age in
Martin, Tennessee

Cancelled - Youth
Retreat at Big Reedy
For 7th grade through
college age cancelled.
See Will Gott for more
details.
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31

Evangelism
University College
Age - Martin TN
For college age in
Martin, Tennessee

Sun AM Bible Study

5th Sunday Service
The contribution will
be used toward the
building debt. Young
men of Mt. Pleasant
will lead Sunday
evening services.

Sun AM Worship
Service

Bible Bowl Practice
5:00 pm at the
building!

Baby Shower for Will
and Kelsey
2:00pm - 4:00pm
Rescheduled from
January 24th. In the
fellowship hall.
Everyone is invited.
They are registered at
Target and Toys"R"us
under Kelsey Gott,
and Kellyscloset.com
under registry name
Kelsey Gott, password
Gottbaby.

Elder/Deacons
Meeting
5:00pm - 6:00pm

Sun PM Worship
Service

Category Key
4th & 5th Sunday Services

Anniversaries

Area Events

Birthdays

Gospel Meetings

Lads-to-Leaders/Leaderettes

Meetings

Special Events

Worship Assemblies

Youth
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