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Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday

1

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

Sun PM Worship
Service

2 3 4

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

5 6 7

8

Daylight Savings
Time
Daylight Savings Time
will begin on Sunday,
March 8th. Move your
clocks ahead one
hour and don’t be late
for Sunday Bible
Study and Worship
Services!

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

Foundation
Christian Academy
Open House
2:00pm - 4:00pm
Foundation Christian
Academy Open
House from 2:00-4:00
PM. Everyone is
invited to attend. For
more details, see
Melissa Young.

Franklin Church of
Christ Gospel
Meeting
Speaker - Mike Baker
from Crieve Hall
Church of Christ in
Nashville, TN. More
details on our bulletin
board.

Sun PM Worship
Service

9

Franklin Church of
Christ Gospel
Meeting
Speaker - Mike Baker
from Crieve Hall
Church of Christ in
Nashville, TN. More
details on our bulletin
board.

10

39ers Breakfast
Time: 8:30 - 39ers
Breakfast at Teresa's
Restaurant

Franklin Church of
Christ Gospel
Meeting
Speaker - Mike Baker
from Crieve Hall
Church of Christ in
Nashville, TN. More
details on our bulletin
board.

11

Franklin Church of
Christ Gospel
Meeting
Speaker - Mike Baker
from Crieve Hall
Church of Christ in
Nashville, TN. More
details on our bulletin
board.

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

12 13 14

7th grade - College
Devo
Time: 4:00 pm - 7th
grade - College Devo
at the church building.
See Will Gott for
details.

15

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

16 17 18

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

19 20 21

Appreciation Dinner
Good Samaritan
Project
The Good Samaritans
host an Elder,
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Sun PM Worship
Service

Deacons, & Preacher
appreciation dinner.

22

Good Samaritan
Easter Egg Project
Good Samaritans
bring in Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS.
See Heather Skaggs
for details.

Sun AM Bible Study

4th Sunday Singing
4th Sunday Singing

Sun AM Worship
Service

Younger Youth
Group Devo
12:00pm - 2:00pm
Youth devo 6th &
below (siblings
welcomed) following
morning services
12-2. Please bring
potluck/finger food
lunch. Desserts &
drinks provided.
Please bring 12 filled
eggs. Sign-up sheet in
the foyer.

Elders/Deacons
Meeting
5:00pm - 6:00pm
Elder/Deacon meeting
in the conference
room at 5 pm.

Sun PM Worship
Service

Lads to Leaders
meeting
Immediately after
morning services this
Sunday for anyone
attending the
convention

23

Good Samaritan
Easter Egg Project
Good Samaritans
bring in Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS.
See Heather Skaggs
for details.

24

Good Samaritan
Easter Egg Project
Good Samaritans
bring in Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS.
See Heather Skaggs
for details.

25

Good Samaritan
Easter Egg Project
Good Samaritans
bring in Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS.
See Heather Skaggs
for details.

Wed PM Bible Study
Time: 6:30pm

26

Good Samaritan
Easter Egg Project
Good Samaritans
bring in Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS.
See Heather Skaggs
for details.

27

Good Samaritan
Easter Egg Project
Good Samaritans
bring in Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS.
See Heather Skaggs
for details.

28

7th grade - College
Devo
Time: 4:00 pm - 7th
grade - College Devo
at the church building.
See Will Gott for
details.

Good Samaritan
Easter Egg Project
Good Samaritans
bring in Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS.
See Heather Skaggs
for details.

Fundamental Truths
Seminar at Lehman
Ave
9:00am - 3:00pm
At Lehman Avenue
Church of Christ. 9 – 3
pm with lunch & child
care provided.
Speakers include Tom
Holland, Mike Greene,
Lance Cordle &
Ashley Hudson
(Ladies Class). More
details on our bulletin
board.

Easter Baskets
Good Samaritan
Project
Put together Easter
baskets for the
children at BRASS

29

Sun AM Bible Study

Sun AM Worship
Service

Sun PM Worship
Service

30 31
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Category Key
4th & 5th Sunday Services

Anniversaries

Area Events

Birthdays

Gospel Meetings

Lads-to-Leaders/Leaderettes

Meetings

Special Events

Worship Assemblies

Youth
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